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Just last Friday & Saturday
( Sept. 22 &23), the Friends 
had one of their big book 
sales.  This is a big project 
and without the help of the 
library staff, it may not 
have happened.  The 
Friends are in need of some 
members to  do projects 
for the library.  If you have 
an interest in helping this 
group of volunteers sup-
port the library, please stop 
in and sign up to be a 
“Friend”. 

The Friends sponsor  book 
sales, bake sales, bus trips 
and other projects to sup-
port the library.  It is a fun 
group and with more 
“hands” there is less work 
for each one.  

The next big project the 
group will be doing will be 
participating in the 
“CHRISTMAS WALK” on 
Dec. 1st .  Planning has just 
begun and again we could 
use more help to make the 
project a success. 

Library Bond Issue………. 
Over the years, the White 

Cloud Community Library 

has experienced steady 

growth and the community 

has come to rely heavily on 

its services. 

Important features of the 

proposed library is a local 

history and genealogy room 

with an archive, an area for 

young adults and teens, 

technology infrastructure, 

quiet areas, a large commu-

nity room, comfortable 

seating, a reference area,  

worktables, staff work areas 

and additional computer 

stations. 

The new building will be 

within walking distance for 

students as well as down-

town businesses. The li-

brary will continue to serve 

the community as center 

for our area’s history as 

well as a center of educa-

tional and recreational in-

formation. 

We all want our community 

to grow and offer more 

services to everyone who 

lives here.  This is an oppor-

tunity for the community to 

get behind a project that 

serves EVERYONE and will 

continue to offer these ser-

vices in years to come. 

- The Library Board 

Friends Update……. 

Name the AUTHOR 

Can you name this chil-

dren’s author? Check the 

back page to see if you 

are right: 
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Inside this issue: 

FRIENDS  meet  

once a month 

on the FIRST 

Thursday of the 

month at 1 pm 

in the library 

meeting room.  

We would love 

to have you join 

us and help the 

library.  
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1. What is your name? 

 Ronald Phillips. 

2. What is one of your favorite quotes?  

 “ What is past is prologue. What is future is epilogue. This 

right here is maybe chapter four or five.” 

     -Welcome to Night Vale Podcast 

3. If you could learn to do anything, what would it be? Why? 

 Deep-sea diving. There are some incredible things down 

there. 

4. What did you do growing up that got you into trouble? 

 Cracking my knuckles, my parents hated it. 

5. If you could meet anyone, living or dead, who would you meet? 

H.P. Lovecraft. He had some strange stories that created an entire mythos 

and it would be interesting to learn about his inspiration. 

6. What would you be doing if you weren’t at your current job? 

 Taking more college classes. 

7. What would you most regret not having done by the end of your life? 

Paying off any and all form of debt or owed favors I may have accumulated.  

8. What would a “perfect” day look like for you? 

 Good food, a comfortable chair, and a marathon of terrible Sci-Fi  movies.  

9. If you ruled the world, what would you change on Day 1? 

 Establish a universal currency. If things are going to get done on a global 

scale, it would speed up the process drastically. 

10. What characteristic do you most admire in others?  

 Self confidence. 



 

1. What is your name? 

Pamela Miller 

2. What is one of your favorite quotes?  

“It is well with my soul.” 

3. If you could learn to do anything, what would it be? Why? 

French & Spanish – So I could speak the language 

when I go to Canada and  Mexico 

4. What did you do growing up that got you into trouble? 

Run away from home 

5. If you could meet anyone, living or dead, who would you meet? 

Jane Davis (4th Great Grandma) 

6. What would you be doing if you weren’t at your current job? 

Laying on a beach on the Gulf – beach bum 

7. What would you most regret not having done by the end of your 

life? 

Sky diving 

8. What would a “perfect” day look like for you? 

Walking on the shore of the gulf 

9. If you ruled the world, what would you change on Day 1? 

Eliminate life time politicians  

10. What characteristic do you most admire in others? 

Honesty 
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Well, it’s finally here. After months and months 

of researching and writing, and gathering in-

formation and proof reading, our second vol-

ume of Newaygo County History and Biogra-

phies is hot off the press. You can purchase this 

book for $25.00 and for an additional $5.00 

have it sent to you. If you missed out of getting 

volume one, we have eight green hardcovers 

on sale for the very discounted price of $35.00, 

down from the original cost of $80.00in 2006.  

Besides the regular histories from places 

around the county (Briggs Lumber, the Pig-

gery, White Cloud State Park and Flowing Well 

for White Cloud) golf courses, newspapers, 

CCC, women’s groups and family photos and 

stories, this one contains family trees.    

 

The first story in the book is 

about Fremont’s Pearl Button 

Factory.  While researching 

this, I realized how fresh wa-

ter mussels found in the local 

rivers were used to make 

pearl buttons.   

Eighty-five tons of shells were 

on hand and expected to keep 

the factory running for five 

months. Women and girls 

were offered full time employ-

ment from 1926 to 1937, when 

it closed.  They were paid an 

average weekly wage of $17 

to $19. Husband and wife 

teams worked at the factory as 

well as high school teens dur-

ing the summer. 

Button cutting was dangerous 

work.  The shells could be 

sharp and spin out of control. 

The workers wore gloves to 

protect their hands.   

When the supply of shells  ran 

low, the workers engaged in a 

work stoppage. On March 25, 

1937, The Fremont Times Indi-

cator reported that all workers 

returned to work. 

When the supply of shells 

from our local mussels ran low 

and shells had to be imported 

from other areas, the shipping 

costs were so high that it was 

decided to close down the op-

eration.  

The crushed shells can still be 

found around today. 

Until then, Pam 

  

  

  

     

Salutations from the 

History Section 
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